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Room: Remote A

 Entry to the Capitol Building is currently limited to authorized personnel only. All committee 
meetings are taking place remotely. 

To view a live stream of the meeting: 
https://olis.oregonlegislature.gov/liz/2021R1/Committees/SJD110/Overview
A viewing station is also available outside of the Capitol Building. 

Work Session
SB 192 

Directs Oregon Criminal Justice Commission to study recidivism rates of persons granted short-
term transitional leave and to provide results of study to interim committees of Legislative 
Assembly no later than December 31, 2021.

SB 193 
Directs State Court Administrator to study issues relating to courts and report to committee or 
interim committee of Legislative Assembly no later than December 31, 2022.

SB 194 
Directs Department of Human Services to study and make recommendations on provisions of 
state law related to juveniles.

SB 195 
Directs Department of Justice to study law enforcement officers.

SB 196 
Directs Department of Justice to study issues related to disposition of convictions based on 
nonunanimous jury verdicts and to provide results of study to interim committees of Legislative 
Assembly no later than December 31, 2021.

SB 197 
Directs State Court Administrator to study lawsuits.

Staff: 
     Channa Newell, Counsel 
     Gillian Fischer, Counsel 
     Michael Lantz, Counsel 
     Amie Fender-Sosa, Counsel 
     Leslie Wu, Counsel 
     Mike Reiley, Sr. Committee Assistant 
     Lisa Rybloom, Committee Assistant 
     Amarit Ubhi, Committee Assistant 

Members:  
     Sen. Floyd Prozanski, Chair  
     Sen. Kim Thatcher, Vice-Chair  
     Sen. Michael Dembrow  
     Sen. Sara Gelser  
     Sen. Dallas Heard  
     Sen. Dennis Linthicum  
     Sen. James Manning Jr.  
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AGENDA (cont.)
April 12, 2021
SB 198 
Directs Department of Public Safety Standards and Training to study public safety and to submit 
findings and recommendations for legislation to interim committee of Legislative Assembly 
related to judiciary.

SB 807 
Requires Oregon Health Authority to research, study and compare behavioral health treatments in 
other states and report findings and conclusions to interim judiciary committees of Legislative 
Assembly no later than September 20, 2022.

SB 808 
Directs Oregon Liquor Control Commission to study cannabis.

SB 809 
Directs State Court Administrator to study fees.

SB 810 
Directs Oregon Criminal Justice Commission to study recidivism rates of persons ordered to pay 
fine as part of sentence and to provide results of study to interim committees of Legislative 
Assembly no later than December 31, 2021.

SB 811 
Directs Department of Corrections to study issues relating to community corrections financial 
grants to counties and to provide results of study to Legislative Assembly no later than December 
31, 2021.

SB 813 
Directs State Court Administrator to study civil proceedings.

SB 815 
Directs Oregon Criminal Justice Commission to study recidivism rates of persons granted pardon 
and to provide results of study to interim committees of Legislative Assembly no later than 
December 31, 2021.

SB 835 
Modifies procedures for early medical release of adult in custody from prison.

SJM 1 
Urges Congress to enact legislation implementing internal Immigration and Customs 
Enforcement policy prohibiting enforcement actions in sensitive locations.

Note change: SB 774 Work Session removed.

Unless otherwise noted on the agenda, testimony is only accepted by committees for bills or 
topics scheduled for a public hearing. See the Oregon Legislature’s website for information on 
contacting individual legislators directly on bills or topics not scheduled for a public hearing.
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