
Dear Representative Williamson and Members of the House Committee on Judiciary,  
 
My name is Michael Gilbert, and I am writing in regards to HB 2797, also known as Taylor’s Law. I 
am an epidemiologist with a professional focus on evaluation of drug-related public policy, and an 
Oregon resident who has lost numerous loved ones to drug overdose. I encourage you to oppose 
passage of HB 2797 on grounds that it proposes a costly and ineffective response to the tragedy 
facing Oregon’s communities, that it imposes new and unnecessary risks to public health and safety, 
and that it represents an unfortunate misuse of political and fiscal capital that could otherwise be 
effectively directed in service of a better Oregon.  
 
One critical shortcoming of the proposed legislation is that its construction of a target population is 
both poorly defined and liable to unfortunate and foreseeable negative consequences. The language 
of the Bill identifies individuals ‘convicted of the unlawful delivery or manufacture of a controlled 
substance that results in the death of another person from the use of the controlled substance’ as 
the target population, which in practice may apply to bystanders, housemates, spouses and other 
associates implicated in a given case. In other States where such statutes exist, enhanced 
sentencing requirements have been applied in ways that are inconsistent with the intent of their 
authors, and have led to the the imprisonment of individuals who are themselves the bereaved 
friends and family members of people lost to overdose.    ​ ​These sentencing requirements also 1 2 3

pose serious impediments to bystander willingness to call upon emergency services in the event of 
an overdose, and may undermine the effectiveness of Oregon’s Good Samaritan laws. In cases 
where people have engaged in the collective purchase of controlled substances, the provisions of 
the proposed Bill would undermine incentives to engagement with life-saving emergency services in 
response to overdose events. If the intent of this legislation is to provide solace to the bereaved and 
justice for the dead, I would implore you to recognize that it risks causing unnecessary death and 
suffering for which no amount of incarceration will provide relief. Taylor’s loss is tragic, and we 
should do everything we can to ensure that risks facing people who use drugs are attenuated rather 
than exacerbated, lest more families be left to grieve. 
 
A second critical shortcoming of the proposed legislation is that it would incur significant costs to the 
State without countervailing benefits to public health or safety. Mandatory minimum sentencing 
statutes consistently fail to achieve intended outcomes across measures of deterrence, 
incapacitation, or public health impact. The failures of mandatory minimum sentences to deter illicit 
distribution of controlled substances or confer health and safety benefits at either individual or 
population levels are well documented in the criminal justice and epidemiological literature.    An 4 5 6

area of particular concern is that these policies do not prove to be cost-effective for their intended 
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purposes , while alternate statutory opportunities such as the authorization of safer consumption 7

spaces remain unpursued in Oregon’s legislature despite growing evidence of their efficacy and 
cost-effectiveness.​    8 9 10

 

I hope that the House Committee on Judiciary will recognize the shortcomings of this Bill and 
prevent its passage into law in favor of more efficacious opportunities to learn from Taylor’s loss and 
support the safety and wellbeing of all Oregonians.  
 
Sincerely,  
 
Michael Gilbert, MPH 
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